
Rules governing the Student Rights Protection Unit 

 

The University Student Rights and Obligations Document was drawn up, with the aim of making 
students aware of their academic and service rights provided to them by the university according to 
its capabilities, how to obtain these rights and the competent authority for that. It also aims to 
make them aware of their obligations towards the university, out of the university’s concern for the 
quality of academic work and the related matters. A close connection between the student on the 
one hand and the university professor and university agencies and units on the other hand, and 
what the state of that relationship should be in terms of transparency and clarity with the various 
components of university work in its various fields. 

 

  

 

* Student rights in the academic field 

 

- His right to provide an appropriate study environment to achieve comprehension and study easily 
and conveniently by providing all available educational capabilities to serve this goal. 

 

- Obtaining academic material and knowledge related to the university courses he studies, in 
accordance with the university provisions and regulations that govern academic work. 

 

- Obtaining the study plans of the college or department and the specializations available to it, as 
well as reviewing the study schedules before starting the study and registering in the courses 
provided by the system and the registration rules, taking into account the order of priorities in 
registering for students. 

 

- Delete any course, add another, or delete the entire semester in accordance with what is provided 
by the university’s study and registration system within the period specified for that. 

 

- University faculty members adhere to the dates and times of lectures, complete academic and 
laboratory hours for them, and do not cancel lectures or change their times except in cases of 
necessity and after announcing this, provided that alternative lectures are given for those that were 
canceled or absent. 

 



- Inquiry and appropriate scientific discussion with faculty members, without censorship or 
punishment, unless the discussion exceeds what is required by public morals and the limits of 
decency and behavior in such cases. 

 

- His right to have exam questions included in the course, its contents, and the issues raised or 
referred to during lectures, and to take into account the balanced and logical distribution of grades 
in order to achieve a fair assessment of the student’s abilities. 

 

- His right to take all the tests held for the course unless there is a legal impediment that prevents 
them from being conducted in accordance with the regulations and instructions related to that, 
provided that the student is notified that he is denied taking the test well in advance. 

 

- His right to know the model answer to the semester exam questions and the distribution of grades 
for the answer parts, on the basis of which the student’s performance is evaluated before taking the 
final exam for the course. 

 

- His right to request review of his answer in the final exam in accordance with what is determined 
by the regulations and decisions issued by the university in regulating the mechanism and controls 
of that review. 

 

- His right to know the results he obtained in the tests he took after completing their correction and 
approval. 

 

  

 

His rights in the non-academic field 

 

- Enjoying the social assistance and care provided by the university and participating in the 
activities held therein in accordance with the university regulations and instructions regulating this. 

 

- Obtaining adequate health care through treatment within the university’s hospitals and health 
centers. 

 



- Benefiting from the university’s services and facilities in accordance with the university’s rules and 
regulations. 

 

- Obtaining the financial incentives and rewards legally prescribed, especially for the outstanding 
student. 

 

- Nominating for training courses, programs, and internal and external trips, and increasing his 
participation in cultural activities, as well as participating in local community service activities and 
volunteer work. 

 

- His right to complain or grievance about any matter that harms him in his relationship with faculty 
members, department, college, or any unit of the university. 

 

- Enable him to defend himself before any party at the university in any disciplinary case brought 
against him, and not issue a penalty against him except after hearing his statements, unless it is 
proven that his failure to attend was for an unacceptable excuse after being summoned for the 
second time. 

 

- His right to appeal the disciplinary decision issued against him in accordance with the rules 
established in this regard under the student disciplinary provisions. 

 

- His right to preserve the contents of his file within the university and the integrity of dealing with it, 
and not to hand over any of it except to the student himself, his guardian, or whomever he officially 
authorizes to do so, except for cases in which it is requested to hand over or know the contents of 
that file by the investigation authorities, judicial bodies, or a governmental body. The contents of his 
file may not be disclosed or published unless such publication is the result of a decision imposing a 
disciplinary penalty against the student. 

 

- The right of a student with special needs to obtain appropriate service appropriate to his needs in 
accordance with applicable regulations and rules. 

 

********** 

 

Buuuuuucks 



 

  

 

Frequently asked questions about the study schedule and tests 

 

  

 

Q: The student’s cumulative GPA fell below the minimum, so what action is taken against him? 

 

A: He will be issued an academic warning due to his cumulative GPA falling below the minimum. 

 

  

 

Q: How is the semester business grade calculated? 

 

A: The semester work grade is calculated through tests, research, and educational activities related 
to the course and which show the student’s achievement during the semester. 

 

  

 

Q: On what basis is the final grade calculated? 

 

A: Semester work grades are added to the final exam grade for each course, and the grade is 
calculated out of 100. 

 

  

 

Q: What is the authority responsible for reviewing disciplinary decisions issued against the 
student? 

 



A: Grievances against disciplinary decisions issued against students shall be considered by the 
University Vice President for Educational and Academic Affairs. 

 

  

 

Q: What procedures and controls must a student adhere to when submitting his complaint to his 
college’s subcommittee? 

 

A: The student must adhere to a number of procedures and controls when submitting his 
complaint: 

 

- To submit his complaint to the headquarters of the subcommittee formed within his college or 
institute. 

 

- The complaint must be submitted within thirty days from the date of the occurrence of the 
incident being complained of, whatever this incident may be (for example: announcing the result of 
a test, an attack on the student verbally or in deed, preventing the student from using one of his 
rights mentioned in the University Student’s Document of Rights and Obligations, etc". 

 

- The student may not submit his complaint after thirty days have passed from the date of the 
occurrence of the incident being complained of, nor may he submit more than one complaint about 
the same incident. 

 

- He must fill out the form prepared for the complaint “Form No. 1” and complete all the data 
contained therein with the necessary accuracy, clarity, and brevity that does not prejudice the 
content, and he receives this form from the secretary of the committee. 

 

After completing it, he submits his complaint form to the secretary of the committee and receives 
from him a receipt indicating that he has submitted the complaint and registered it in the 
committee’s record. 

 

- The student will follow up on his complaint and what happened in it for a period of thirty days 
starting from the date of his submission of the complaint, by reviewing and asking the secretary of 
the committee at the headquarters designated for that purpose. 
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